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FW: Grant

From: Peter Minucos <peter.minucos@deputypremier.nsw.gov.au>
To: Daryl Maguire <daryl.maguire@parliament.nsw.gov.au>

Cc: Fiona Dewar <fiona.dewar@deputypremier.nsw.gov.au>
Date: Tue, 30 May 2017 12:25:29 +1000

Hi Daryl,

I’'ve spoken to Tony and given him the update:

e We've been in constant dialogue with the Department and almost ready to go on this
one now.

e The new information in the business case demonstrated the dual aims of the project
(shooting & conference facility) to enable the economic appraisal to assess those
benefits.

e The letter with the positive economic appraisal is being prepared for Infrastructure NSW
now.

e That will enable INSW to recommend to ERC that the project be funded out of Restart
NSW (Regional Tourism infrastructure) and once ERC approves, the deeds can be drawn
up.

e INSW are due to receive the economic appraisal this week and we will look to fast track
the approval process over the ensuing couple of weeks — it is a matter of INSW and ERC
meeting to provide approval.

| think it registered well with Tony that this is the “poles and wires money” being invested in
regional infrastructure and that’s why there’s a few hurdles to clear.

Cheers, peter

Peter Minucos

Senior Policy Adviser

Office of The Hon. John Barilaro MP
Deputy Premier

Minister for Regional NSW

Minister for Skills

Minister for Small Business

Tel: 168

Email: peter.minucos@deputypremier.nsw.gov.au

From: Fiona Dewar

Sent: Tuesday, 30 May 2017 10:32 AM

To: Peter Minucos; gary.barnes@dpc.nsw.gov.au
Subject: Fwd: Grant

Sent from my iPad

Begin forwarded message:

From: Daryl Maguire <Daryl.Maguire@parliament.nsw.gov.au>
Date: 30 May 2017 at 9:45:57 am AEST

To: 'Fiona Dewar' <Fiona.Dewar@minister.nsw.gov.au>
Subject: Fwd: Grant
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Sent from my iPad

Begin forwarded message:

From: Tony Turner <execofficer@claytarget.com.au>
Date: 30 May 2017 9:41:18 am AEST

To: "Daryl Maguire (Daryl.Maguire@parliament.nsw.gov.au)"

<Daryl.Maguire@parliament.nsw.gov.au>
Subject: FW: Grant

Hi Daryl,

| apologise for the annoyance however | have not heard or seen anything
regarding the Grant since the email below.

We anticipate awarding and signing the contract for building in early July
including agreeing to a deposit and timeline for payments based on milestones
for completion of works.

Can you provide me with someone to deal with in relation to the grant so | don’t
have to annoy you.

| have received some phone calls however do not have a specific contact phone
number or email to respond to.

Regards

Tony Turner

National Executive Officer

Australian Clay Target Association Inc
Registered number A12282

ABN: 14 590 029 414

Phone +61 2 69382121

execofficer@claytarget.com.au
"ACTA”

IMPORTANT

The information transmitted is for the use of the intended recipient only and may
contain confidential and/or legally privileged material. Any review, re-
transmission, disclosure dissemination or other use of, or taking of any action in
reliance upon, this information by persons or entities other than the intended
recipient is prohibited and may result in severe penalties. If you have received
this e-mail in error please notify the Australian Clay Target Association Inc. on
(02) 6938 2121 and delete all copies of this transmission together with any
attachments.
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From: Tony Turner

Sent: Wednesday, 10 May 2017 4:53 PM
To: Daryl Maguire

Subject: RE: Grant

Hi Daryl,

Received a call today in relation to the grant, paper work is being prepared,
thanks, sorry to annoy you.

Cheers

Tony Turner

National Executive Officer

Australian Clay Target Association Inc
Registered number A12282

ABN: 14 590 029 414

Phone +61 2 69382121

execofficer@claytarget.com.au
"ACTA”

7]

IMPORTANT

The information transmitted is for the use of the intended recipient only and may
contain confidential and/or legally privileged material. Any review, re-
transmission, disclosure dissemination or other use of, or taking of any action in
reliance upon, this information by persons or entities other than the intended
recipient is prohibited and may result in severe penalties. If you have received
this e-mail in error please notify the Australian Clay Target Association Inc. on
(02) 6938 2121 and delete all copies of this transmission together with any
attachments.

From: Daryl Maguire [mailto:Daryl.Maguire@parliament.nsw.gov.au]
Sent: Wednesday, 10 May 2017 1:17 PM

To: Tony Turner

Subject: RE: Grant

Tony, have you had contact yet ?

From: Tony Turner [mailto:execofficer@claytarget.com.au]
Sent: Monday, 8 May 2017 8:55 AM

To: Daryl Maguire

Subject: Grant

Hi Daryl,

Sorry to be a constant pain, | had the chief of staff from the deputy Premiers
office ring regarding the grant, he said he would send the “paper work” | still
haven’t seen anything and need to understand the terms of the grant for
acquittal purposes and to ensure we are clear on how the money is to be spent.

My understanding is that the money was granted to build the facility of the size as
agreed with former Minister Stuart Ayres.
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| need confirmation of the terms and timeframe for getting access to the grant. |
just want to ensure | adhere to all of the requirements of the grant. Once this is
clear | can have GHD measure and report against it.

The DA was submitted two weeks ago and we have a meeting with Council
tomorrow regarding the submission. We don’t anticipate any further holdups.

The timeframe for commencement is the 15t of July with a completion date of the
6t February 2018.

Cheers

Tony Turner

National Executive Officer

Australian Clay Target Association Inc
Registered number A12282

ABN: 14 590 029 414

Phone +61 2 69382121

execofficer@claytarget.com.au

IMPORTANT

The information transmitted is for the use of the intended recipient only and may
contain confidential and/or legally privileged material. Any review, re-
transmission, disclosure dissemination or other use of, or taking of any action in
reliance upon, this information by persons or entities other than the intended
recipient is prohibited and may result in severe penalties. If you have received
this e-mail in error please notify the Australian Clay Target Association Inc. on
(02) 6938 2121 and delete all copies of this transmission together with any
attachments.
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